
Subject: Re: Water bill again...

From: skybox <skyoptic6@gmail.com>
Date: 04/05/2023, 5:22 AM
To: michaelhuarte@gmail.com

I presume you only want the utility fee paid now since I have not received an answer
back and that you are working on fixing the problem for the future, so I have only
included the $23.74 with the rent this month as all else is pending...

On Tue, Mar 28, 2023 at 2:00 PM skybox <skyoptic6@gmail.com> wrote:
Mr.  Huarte

I have just received my water bill and it shows 0 gallons usage with a beginning and
previous reading of 100, no charge except for the excessive utility fee of $23.74...
last month's current reading was 410900, which I assume should be this month's
previous reading, though it was an identical usage and charge from the month
before.  What exactly is the utility fee for?  I hope your manager isn't planning on
waiting until the end of the year before billing me for everything, and I hope he
doesn't expect me to ask him respectfully for my water bill each and every month. 
The last time I complained, I was greeted with a backed up toilet which he has
bragged about doing to tenants before by running air backwards through the
cleanout trap of the sewer.  Please either include the water with the rent, or fix
whatever is wrong with the system.  Better communication would also be
appreciated.  The best way to contact me is at this email address which has been
valid for many, many years.

Indigo Michaud
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